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This is a common-core course designed to help students develop their academic writing and 

presentation skills. Students will be expected to read academic texts and write an academic paper 

by synthesizing information from a variety of sources. They will also learn how to give end-text 

citations. In addition to improving their writing skills, students will have the chance to learn 

presentation skills and to practice them in class. In this context, Student Survey evaluated students 

enrolled in the ENG102 course as presented in Table 1. 

The survey was conducted with 42 respondents out of 318 total participants, resulting in a response 

rate of 13.20%. The majority of respondents were from the Faculty of Engineering (30.95%), 

followed by the Faculty of Education (23.81%) and the Faculty of Economics and Administrative 

Sciences (19.05%). 

Table 1. Evaluation of Student Survey in ENG102 Expository Writing Micro-Credential Course 

Item 
Strongly 
Disagree 

(%) 

Disagree 
(%) 

Neither 
Agree nor 

Disagree (%) 

Agree 
(%) 

Strongly 
Agree (%) 

Mean 
(M) 

The micro credential course 
helped me develop my 
presentation skills. 

11.90 2.38 26.19 33.33 26.19 2.50 

The content of the micro 
credential course was 
related to the ENG102 
course. 

2.38 0.00 9.52 45.24 42.86 3.28 

The level of difficulty of 
the content was appropriate. 2.38 4.76 26.19 28.57 38.10 3.21 
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The videos were of good 
quality (i.e., video and 
sound quality). 

2.38 4.76 16.67 40.48 35.71 3.18 

The length of the videos 
was okay. 2.38 2.38 19.05 42.86 33.33 3.20 

The workload in the micro 
credential course was 
manageable. 

2.38 0.00 19.05 30.95 47.62 3.24 

The micro credential course 
enabled me to reflect on my 
own presentation skills. 

7.14 9.52 19.05 28.57 35.71 2.76 

Questions in the videos 
helped me to better 
understand the content. 

2.38 4.76 11.90 50.00 30.95 3.27 

There were a variety of 
activities following each 
video. 

2.38 0.00 19.05 40.48 38.10 3.26 

Activities following each 
video were engaging. 4.76 0.00 16.67 47.62 30.95 3.14 

Receiving a digital badge 
motivated me to complete 
the course. 

9.52 4.76 14.29 26.19 45.24 2.92 

It was easy to navigate in 
the course. 2.38 0.00 11.90 38.10 47.62 3.29 

Technical support provided 
was satisfactory. 2.38 0.00 14.29 42.86 40.48 3.22 

The 10 points allocated for 
the micro credential course 
were appropriate. 

4.76 0.00 14.29 28.57 52.38 3.24 

I would recommend this 
course to future ENG102 
students. 

4.76 9.52 19.05 19.05 47.62 2.95 

I would take more micro 
credential courses if offered 
at the university. 

7.14 7.14 11.90 33.33 40.48 2.93 

The ENG102 Micro-Credential Student Survey results indicate that students found the course 

helpful in developing their presentation skills, with a particular emphasis on video quality, course 

navigation, and technical support. Most students agreed that the course content was relevant to 

ENG102 and that the level of difficulty was appropriate. 



Areas for improvement include further engaging activities, ensuring workload balance, and 

increasing the perceived value of digital badges. A follow-up evaluation will assess improvements 

based on these suggestions. 

     


